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Indeks : Copernicus
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1. | Submission Stage 16 Agustus 2013
2. | Review and Revision Stage 17 Agustus 2013
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5. | Publishing Stage 13 September 2013




Submission Stage



Re: Manuscript submit

Dari: The Editor, Academic Research International (editor.arint@gmail.com)
Kepada: bmb_pur@yahoo.com
Tanggal: Sabtu, 17 Agustus 2013 18.03 GMT+7

Dear Author,

Thank you for submitting paper(s) to "Academic Research International (ARInt.)" for September 2013 issue. We will inform you after completing
peer review process within 2-3 weeks:

AR-ID: 0405-1280-SS-82013

Title: FUZZY LOGIC CONTROLLER FOR VOLTS/HZ INDUCTION MOTOR CONTOL USED IN ELECTRICALLY DRIVEN MARINE
PROPELLER

Author(s): Bambang Purwahyudi, Saidah, Hasti Afianti
Words:2588

Publication Fee: USD70

Subscription for print @USD 30per copy (Optional)
Country: INDONESIA

[Note: Article publication fee is 70USD (or 6900PKR) for paper not more than 4000 words. 0.02USD will be charged for each additional word. If
the paper is accepted for publication, you will be asked to pay article publication fee. For details http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/authors.html].

Please visit http://www.journals.savap.org.pk for updates and remember to quote the reference number in any communication with us.

With best wishes,

The Editorial Team,
Academic Research International (AR Int.)

ISSN-L: 2223-9553
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk

On Fri, Aug 16, 2013 at 8:22 AM, Bambang Purwahyudi <bmb pur@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear ARInt. Editors,

We would like to submit our paper with the title is "Fuzzy Logic Controller for Volts/Hz Induction Motor Control Used in
Electrically Driven Marine Propeller". Please accept and review our paper.

Thank you very much for the cooperation.
Sincerely yours,

Bambang Purwahyudi
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Review and Revision Stage



Bls: Manuscript submit

Dari: Bambang Purwahyudi (bmb_pur@yahoo.com)
Kepada: editor.arint@gmail.com

Cc bmb_pur@yahoo.com

Tanggal: Sabtu, 31 Agustus 2013 16.24 GMT+7

Dear ARInt. Journal Editors,

We would like to know about the result of peer review process for our paper.
Thank you very much for the cooperation.

Sincerely yours,

Bambang Purwahyudi

Dari: "The Editor, Academic Research International" <editor.arint@gmail.com>
Kepada: Bambang Purwahyudi <bmb_pur@yahoo.com>

Dikirim: Sabtu, 17 Agustus 2013 18:03

Judul: Re: Manuscript submit

Dear Author,

Thank you for submitting paper(s) to "Academic Research International (ARInt.)" for September 2013 issue. We will inform you
after completing peer review process within 2-3 weeks:

AR-ID: 0405-1280-SS-82013

Title: FUZZY LOGIC CONTROLLER FOR VOLTS/HZ INDUCTION MOTOR CONTOL USED IN ELECTRICALLY
DRIVEN MARINE PROPELLER

Author(s): Bambang Purwahyudi, Saidah, Hasti Afianti

Words:2588

Publication Fee: USD70

Subscription for print @USD 30per copy (Optional)

Country: INDONESIA

[Note: Article publication fee is 70USD (or 6900PKR) for paper not more than 4000 words. 0.02USD will be charged for each
additional word. If the paper is accepted for publication, you will be asked to pay article publication fee. For details
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/authors.html].

Please visit http://www.journals.savap.org.pk for updates and remember to quote the reference number in any communication
with us.

With best wishes,

The Editorial Team,

Academic Research International (AR Int.)
ISSN-L: 2223-9553
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk
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Aceptance Stage



Re: Manuscript submit

Dari: The Editor, Academic Research International (editor.arint@gmail.com)
Kepada: bmb_pur@yahoo.com
Tanggal: Selasa, 3 September 2013 15.08 GMT+7

Dear Author,

Thank you for submitting paper(s) to "Academic Research International (ARInt.)". It is to notify you that your paper has been accepted for Vol.
04 No.05, September 2013 issue. You are requested to transfer publication fee up to Sep 6, 2013. Reference number for this submission is:

AR-ID: 0405-1280-SS-82013

Title: FUZZY LOGIC CONTROLLER FOR VOLTS/HZ INDUCTION MOTOR CONTOL USED IN ELECTRICALLY DRIVEN MARINE
PROPELLER

Author(s): Bambang Purwahyudi, Saidah, Hasti Afianti
Words:2588

Publication Fee: USD70

Subscription for print @USD 30per copy (Optional)
Country: INDONESIA

[Note: Article publication fee is US$ 70 (or PKR 7000) per paper not more than 4000 words. Fee for each additional word is 0.02USD. For
details http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/authors.html]

If you want to receive copy of print version, you have to pay USD30 subscription. It is optional.

OPTION 1: By PAYPAL (Please visit https://www.paypal.com )
Please transfer publication fee +5% charges to email account editor.arint@savap.org.pk

You may use your Paypal Account or Debit/ Credit Card of Visa / Master / American Express /JCB / DISCOVER for transfer of payment.

OPTION 2: PAY BY WESTERN UNION (Please visit http://www.westernunion.com/)

Details for Payment:

First name of addressee:MUHAMMAD ASHRAF
Last name (Surname): MALIK

Location: PAKISTAN

After payment please send us MTCN (money transfer control number). We will include your paper in list of next issue page on website as
confirmation.

OPTION 3a: PAY BY BANK TRANSFER (USD Account)

Our USD bank accounts information is as follows:

Bank Name & Address Meezan Bank Limited, Pakistan.
IBAN PK29MEZN0060010100540545
Beneficiary Name MALIK MUHAMMAD ASHRAF
Beneficiary Account Number (USD) | 6001 0100540545

Bank Swift Code MEZNPKKA (AD-150)

Bank Branch Name & Code Lodhran- (6001)

OPTION 3b: PAY BY BANK TRANSFER (PKR Account) [USD70=PKR7000]

Our PKR bank account information is as follows:

Bank Account Name SAVAP International

Bank Account Number 0141 7900660001

Swift Code HABBPKKA

Bank Name & Address Habib Bank Limited, Pakistan.
Branch Name Lodhran- Fawara Chowk (0141)

After receiving scanned copy of bank receipt and confirmation from our bank, we will include your paper in list of next issue page on website
as confirmation.

Please visit http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/for updates and remember to quote the reference number in any communication with us.
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With best regards,

The Editorial Team,
Academic Research International (AR Int.)

ISSN-L: 2223-9553
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/

On Sat, Aug 31, 2013 at 6:24 PM, Bambang Purwahyudi <bmb_pur@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear ARInt. Journal Editors,

We would like to know about the result of peer review process for our paper.
Thank you very much for the cooperation.

Sincerely yours,

Bambang Purwahyudi

Dari: "The Editor, Academic Research International" <editor.arint@gmail.com>
Kepada: Bambang Purwahyudi <bmb pur@yahoo.com>

Dikirim: Sabtu, 17 Agustus 2013 18:03

Judul: Re: Manuscript submit

Dear Author,

Thank you for submitting paper(s) to "Academic Research International (ARInt.)" for September 2013 issue. We will
inform you after completing peer review process within 2-3 weeks:

AR-ID: 0405-1280-SS-82013

Title: FUZZY LOGIC CONTROLLER FOR VOLTS/HZ INDUCTION MOTOR CONTOL USED IN ELECTRICALLY
DRIVEN MARINE PROPELLER

Author(s): Bambang Purwahyudi, Saidah, Hasti Afianti

Words:2588

Publication Fee: USD70

Subscription for print @USD 30per copy (Optional)

Country: INDONESIA

[Note: Article publication fee is 70USD (or 6900PKR) for paper not more than 4000 words. 0.02USD will be charged for
each additional word. If the paper is accepted for publication, you will be asked to pay article publication fee. For details
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/authors.html].

Please visit http://www.journals.savap.org.pk for updates and remember to quote the reference number in any
communication with us.

With best wishes,

The Editorial Team,

Academic Research International (AR Int.)
ISSN-L: 2223-9553
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk
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Payment Stage



Re: Payment proof for publication fee and copy journal

Dari: The Editor, Academic Research International (editor.arint@gmail.com)
Kepada: bmb_pur@yahoo.com
Tanggal: Kamis, 5 September 2013 18.17 GMT+7

Dear Author,
Thank you for transfer of fee to our Bank account. We have included the following paper(s) in list of September 2013 issue:
AR-ID: 0405-1280-SS-82013

Title: FUZZY LOGIC CONTROLLER FOR VOLTS/HZ INDUCTION MOTOR CONTOL USED IN ELECTRICALLY DRIVEN MARINE
PROPELLER

Author(s): Bambang Purwahyudi, Saidah, Hasti Afianti
Words:2588

Publication Fee Paid: USD70

Subscription paid for print @USD 30per copy: USD30
Country: INDONESIA

The title of paper has been included to webpage of next issue. Please visit the “Academic Research International” website at
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/nextissue.html or http://journals.savap.org.pk/vol4n5.html for updates.

Again, thank you for selecting “Academic Research International” for publishing your research work. Looking forward for your valuable
contribution and support in future.

Sincerely,
Editorial Team
Academic Research International (AR Int.)

ISSN-L: 2223-9553
URL: http://www.journals.savap.org.pk

Email: editor.arint@gmail.com, editor.arint@savap.org.pk

On Thu, Sep 5, 2013 at 1:53 PM, Bambang Purwahyudi <bmb_pur@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear ARInt. Editorial Team,

We would like to submit the payment proof for publication fee and 1 copy journal. Please find the payment proof attached.
Thank you very much for the cooperation.

Best Regards,

Bambang Purwahyudi

Department of Electrical Engineering
Faculty of Engineering

University of Bhayangkara Surabaya
JI. Achmad Yani No. 114

Surabaya, INDONESIA.

Dari: "The Editor, Academic Research International” <editor.arint@gmail.com>
Kepada: Bambang Purwahyudi <bmb_pur@yahoo.com>

Dikirim: Selasa, 3 September 2013 15:08

Judul: Re: Manuscript submit

Dear Author,
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Thank you for submitting paper(s) to "Academic Research International (ARInt.)". It is to notify you that your paper has been accepted
for Vol. 04 No.05, September 2013 issue. You are requested to transfer publication fee up to Sep 6, 2013. Reference number for this
submission is:

AR-ID: 0405-1280-SS-82013

Title: FUZZY LOGIC CONTROLLER FOR VOLTS/HZ INDUCTION MOTOR CONTOL USED IN ELECTRICALLY
DRIVEN MARINE PROPELLER

Author(s): Bambang Purwahyudi, Saidah, Hasti Afianti

Words:2588

Publication Fee: USD70

Subscription for print @USD 30per copy (Optional)

Country: INDONESIA

[Note: Article publication fee is US$ 70 (or PKR 7000) per paper not more than 4000 words. Fee for each additional word is 0.02USD.
For details http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/authors.html]

If you want to receive copy of print version, you have to pay USD30 subscription. It is optional.

OPTION 1: By PAYPAL (Please visit https://www.paypal.com )

Please transfer publication fee +5% charges to email account editor.arint@savap.org.pk

You may use your Paypal Account or Debit/ Credit Card of Visa / Master / American Express /JCB / DISCOVER for transfer of
payment.

OPTION 2: PAY BY WESTERN UNION (Please visit http://www.westernunion.com/)

Details for Payment:

First name of addressee:MUHAMMAD ASHRAF
Last name (Surname): MALIK
Location: PAKISTAN

After payment please send us MTCN (money transfer control number). We will include your paper in list of next issue page on website
as confirmation.

OPTION 3a: PAY BY BANK TRANSFER (USD Account)

Our USD bank accounts information is as follows:

Bank Name & Address Meezan Bank Limited, Pakistan.
IBAN PK29MEZN0060010100540545
Beneficiary Name MALIK MUHAMMAD ASHRAF
Beneficiary Account Number (USD) | 6001 0100540545

Bank Swift Code MEZNPKKA (AD-150)

Bank Branch Name & Code Lodhran- (6001)

OPTION 3b: PAY BY BANK TRANSFER (PKR Account) [USD70=PKR7000]

Our PKR bank account information is as follows:

Bank Account Name SAVAP International

Bank Account Number 0141 7900660001

Swift Code HABBPKKA

Bank Name & Address Habib Bank Limited, Pakistan.
Branch Name Lodhran- Fawara Chowk (0141)

After receiving scanned copy of bank receipt and confirmation from our bank, we will include your paper in list of next issue page on
website as confirmation.

Please visit http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/for updates and remember to quote the reference number in any communication with us.

With best regards,

The Editorial Team,

Academic Research International (AR Int.)
ISSN-L: 2223-9553
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/
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Publishing Stage



Vol.4 (5) September 2013 issue Part-I is ready for press.

Dari: The Editor, Academic Research International (editor.arint@gmail.com)
Kepada: editor.arint@savap.org.pk
Tanggal: Jumat, 13 September 2013 05.51 GMT+7

Dear Author (s),
Thank you for your valuable contribution to Academic Research International.
Copy of Vol.4 (5) September 2013 issue Part-l is ready for press.

Please visit ‘Current Issue’ webpage or http://journals.savap.org.pk/vol4n5.html and download galley proof of your
paper for final checking. It is requested to inform us within three days.

With regards
The Editorial Team,
Academic Research International (AR Int.)

ISSN-L: 2223-9553
http://www.journals.savap.org.pk/
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